
REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA CARLETON MEMORANDUM
MUNICIPALITÉ RÉGIONALE D’OTTAWA CARLETON NOTE DE SERVICE

Our File/N/Réf. 03  06-97-0017
Your File/V/Réf.

DATE 31 August 1997

TO/DEST. The Chair and Members of  Council

FROM/EXP. Regional Clerk

SUBJECT/OBJET RECORD OF TENDER OPENINGS
FOR THE MONTH OF AUGUST 1997
(AS PER CORPORATE POLICY MANUAL SECTION 4.6.6)

BACKGROUND

In accordance with Section 4. 6. 6, Opening of Tenders, of the Corporate Policy Manual,
“all tenders shall be received by the Clerk and shall be opened in public by the Clerk at the time
specified in the tender documents.”

Tender documents are officially opened by the Regional Clerk’s designate on every Tuesday of
the month after 3:00 p.m.  On occasion, such as during the idle construction season, tenders may
not be called and tender openings are not conducted.

Attached for your information are the Records of Tender Openings for August 05, 12, 19 and 26,
1997.  It is our intention to directly provide all Councillors with the Record of Tender Openings
on a regular basis, so that Councillors may be informed of  Regional activities.

Approved by
Mary Jo Woollam
Regional Clerk

Attach (4)
c.c. Directors/Managers of Administration and/or Finance

INFORMATION PREVIOUSLY DISTRIBUTED
TO BE LISTED ON CORPORATE
SERVICES AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
COMMITTEE AGENDA - 16 September 97



Clerk’s File No.:  06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 05 AUGUST 1997

R. Nelson, Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

W. Bennett, Environment & Transportation Department
P. Steacy,  Environment & Transportation Department
N. Stout, Environment & Transportation Department
B. Hilborn, Finance Department
C. Moore, Finance Department
C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department

The tenders were taken by the Environment & Transportation Department for evaluation and
recommendation.

1. BRONSON AVENUE - DUNBAR BRIDGE
TRANSITION AND SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
CONTRACT NO.:  97-507

Karson Kartage & Konstr. $                645,000.00
Tarcon Limited    652,451.05
Tarmac Minerals    665,165.51
Deschenes Construction    683,061.00

2. TRANSITWAY REHABILITATION PROGRAMME,
SOUTHWEST TRANSITWAY
CONTRACT NO.:97-604

K.B. Ray Construction $     359,543.00
Thomas G. Fuller & Sons     360,735.00
Louis W.  Bray Construction     412,957.00

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.:  06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 12 AUGUST 1997

M. Beauregard, Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

M. Alkoka, Environment & Transportation Department
R. Crete, Environment & Transportation Department
Z. Ghadban, Environment & Transportation Department
S. Harish, Environment & Transportation Department
L. Leblanc, Environment & Transportation Department
J. Toeg, Environment & Transportation Department
T. Woytowich, Environment & Transportation Department
D. Goodwin, Finance Department
B. Mooney, Finance Department
C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, City of Ottawa

The tenders were taken by the  Environment & Transportation Department for evaluation and
recommendation.

1. PARKING GARAGE REPAIRS - OCRPS
CONTRACT NO.:  9999-07570-T1/97

Eric’s Concrete $   60,700.00
DRL Restoration   72,640.00
Zimola Construction Ltd.   73,232.00
Martin & Martin   82,701.00

2. GLEN CAIRN TRUNK SEWER - PHASE 2
GLEN CAIRN
CONTRACT NO.:97-202

Dufferin Construction $  1,998,059.50
Ottawa Greenbelt Construction  2,000,000.00
Taggart Construction  2,147,500.00
888342 Ontario Inc.  2,226,735.00
Colautti Construction  2,278,438.00
Vanson Construction  2,368,835.00



3. WATERMAIN INSTALLATION,
RIVERSIDE DRIVE, HUNT CLUB TO KIMBERWICK CRES.
CONTRACT NO.:97-327

Colautti Construction $      90,945.00
Vanson Construction     112,150.00
Dufferin Construction     114,118.50
K.C.E. Construction     115,230.75
Madison Excavating     117,339.00
Graydex Ottawa     120,103.00
Ottawa Greenbelt Construction     120,497.50
C.A.C.E. Construction     122,783.50
George W. Drummond     123,759.45
E. Geo. Brown Excavating     129,453.75
W.B. Maloney Construction     133,575.00
888342 Ontario Inc.     147,170.00
Pedro Construction     150,081.50

4. CONSTRUCTION OF AN INTERIM GAS COLLECTION SYSTEM - STAGE 3,
TRAIL ROAD LANDFILL
CONTRACT NO.:97-400

C.A.C.E. $     165,245.00
W.B. Maloney Construction     198,500.00
Landry Mechanical     229.000.00

5. INSTALLATION OF METHANE VENTS, SITE PREPARATION,
GRADING AND SEEDING
160 LEES AVENUE
CONTRACT NO.:97-524

888342 Ontario Inc. $     231,245.00
Geo. W. Drummond     231,574.00
Bradley-Kelly Construction     233,532.00
Taggart Construction     236,704.00
Skarlan Enterprises     263,185.00

Vanson Construction     293,977.00
Martin & Martin     329,094.00
Beaver Road Builders     441,379.00



6. REPAIRS TO ASPHALTIC PAVEMENT,
VARIOUS REGIONAL ROADS
CONTRACT NO.:97-811

Deschenes Construction $     155,085.00
O’Leary’s Ltd.     166,451.25
C.H. Construction     174,730.00
Tarcon Ltd.     195,496.00
Arnone Paving     196,413.00

7. SURFACE TREATMENT TO SHOULDERS,
FISHER AVENUE ETC.
CONTRACT NO.:97-812

Miller Paving Inc. $      93,683.50

8. HIRE OF COMBINATION SPREADER/PLOW TRUCK UNITS,
CONTRACT NO.:97-822

P.T.W. Vanzyl & Sons Ltd. $     114,400.00
1202840 Ontario Inc.     115,830.00
Willard Hays     121,000.00
Goldie Mohr Ltd.     722,463.25
McKinley Equipment     797,500.00

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.:  06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 19 AUGUST 1997

B. O’Gorman, Deputy Clerk
(received and opened tenders)

J. Draper, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
W. Coombe, Environment & Transportation Department
Z. Ghadban, Environment & Transportation Department
S. Harish, Environment & Transportation Department
M. Ross, Environment & Transportation Department
B. Hilborn, Finance Department
C.. Moore, Finance Department
N. Kiwaskie, Structures
J. Pagani, Structures
W. Fedec, Police Services Board
C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department

The tenders were taken by the Finance Department, Supply Management Division, and the
Environment & Transportation Department for  evaluation and recommendation.

1. WATERMAIN REHABILITATION REPLACEMENT
MILLBROOK CRESCENT, HILLIARD AVE. TO DEER PARK RD.
CONTRACT NO.:  97-300

E. Geo. Brown Excavating $     190,625.00
K.C.E. Construction     200,275.00
Graydex Ottawa     203.351.00
Colautti Construction     208,623.00
Pedro Construction     219,737.00
Vanson Construction     222,375.00
Ottawa Greenbelt Construction     228,120.00
W.B. Maloney Construction     228,200.00
GEO. W. Drummond     228,641.00
C.A.C.E. Construction     231,250.00



2. REPLACEMENT WATERMAIN
STANWOOD AVENUE
CONTRACT NO.: 97-314

Colautti Construction $     106,065.00
Vanson Construction     111,515.00
Graydex Ottawa     113,580.00
Ottawa Greenbelt Construction     125,980.00
Madison Excavating     126,285,00
Pedro Construction     128,908.00
W.B. Maloney Construction     131,535.00
K.C.E. Construction     136,650.00
C.A.C.E. Construction     141,120.00
GEO. W. Drummond     157,270.00

3. WATERMAIN REPLACEMENT, SEWER REPLACEMENT &
ROAD RECONSTRUCTION
GLADSTONE AVENUE
CONTRACT NO.: 97-325

Graydex Ottawa $     211,938.35
Ottawa Greenbelt Construction     212,573.00
Tarmac Minerals     242,509.12
C.A.C.E. Construction     245,402.95
Vanson Construction     254,287.00
E. GEO. Brown Excavating     266,507.00

4. CARLSBAD SPRINGS BRIDGE REPAIRS,
STRUCTURE NO. 2313,
CONTRACT NO.:  97-521

M.J. Robinson Trucking $    88,506.00
Eric’s Concrete & Masonry    93,420.00
Thomas Fuller & Sons   116,395.00
J.C. Sulpher Construction   117,971.00



5. WINTER SAND
CONTRACT NO.:  0750-00NN-T1/97

Burnside Sand Gravel Inc $  *
George W. Drummond Ltd.   *
Karson Kartage Construction   *

* Tenders marked with an asterisk were not recorded as various unit prices were quoted.

6. TOWING SERVICES - PO
CONTRACT NO.: 0968-90-P1/97

561124 Ontario Inc. $ *
Capital Towing *
Gervais Towing *
Kornell’s Towing & Recovery *
Ottawa Towing Service *
R.I.F. Towing Inc. *
Web. Wehbe *

* Tenders marked with an asterisk were not recorded as various unit prices were quoted.

Approved by B. O’Gorman
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.:  06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 26 AUGUST 1997

C. Watson, Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller , Finance Department, Supply Management Division
B. Hilborn, Finance Department
B. Mooney, Finance Department
Z. Ghadban, Environment & Transportation Department
W. Gryz, Environment & Transportation Department
R. Perry, Environment & Transportation Department
J. Toeg, Environment & Transportation Department
B. Wadden, Environment & Transportation Department
P. Wright, Environment & Transportation Department
C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department

The tenders were taken by the Finance Department, Supply Management Division for evaluation
and recommendation.

1. LEBRUN STREET WATERMAIN REHABILITATION
MICHEL CIRCLE TO DES PERES BLANCS
CONTRACT NO.:  97-301

KCE Construction $   111,964.80
Madison Excavating   115,787.00
C.A.C.E. Construction   124,195.00
W.B. Maloney Construction   126,148.00
Vanson Construction   131,125.00
Graydex Ottawa   138,431.00



2. CULVERT REHABILITATION
STRUCTURE NOS. 820 AND 881
CONTRACT NO.:  97-501

C.A.C.E. Construction $   193,842.50
Martin & Martin   197,037.00
Beaver Road Builders Ltd.   219,679.30
Tarmac Minerals   228,377.73
Louis W. Bray Construction   232,912.00
888342 Ontario Inc.   296,220.00

3. CONSTRUCTION OF CYCLING FACILITIES
INNES ROAD - FALLOWFIELD ROAD
CONTRACT NO.:  97-532

Deschenes Construction $   203,265.88
Beaver Road Builders Ltd.   253,726.55
C.H. Construction/ co Laurent Leblanc   320,103.00
Arnone Paving   373,866.50

4. WOODROOFE AVENUE WIDENING OF NORTHBOUND LANE
BETWEEN CNR OVERPASS AND NORICE STREET
CONTRACT NO.:  97-611

Tarmac Minerals $   154,055.03
Tarcon Ltd.   157,669.00
Choctaw Construction   158,694.00
O’Leary’s Ltd.   159,907.55
Geo. W. Drummond Ltd.   167,426.95
Karson Kartage & Konstr   169,000.00
Deschenes Construction   171,000.00



5. HOT IN PLACE RECYCLING OR ASPHALTIC OVERLAY
ROBERTSON ROAD ETC.
CONTRACT NO.:  97-819

“A”
C.H. Construction c/o Laurent Leblanc $   199,760.00
Deschenes Construction   239,000.14
Tarcon Ltd.   No bid
Karson Kartage & Konstr.   No bid
Tarmac Minerals   No bid

“B”
Tarmac Minerals   330,645.67
Karson Kartage & Konstr.   335,000.00
Tarcon Ltd.   335,307.30
Deschenes Construction   No bid
C.H. Construction c/o Laurent Leblanc   No bid

6. THREE (3) MUNICIPAL TRACTORS
CONTRACT NO.:  0022-80-AAO-P1/97

Holder of North America $  *
Craig Construction Equipment   *
H.J. Reis International Ltd.   *
Holder of North America/Scotia Leasing *

* Tenders marked with an asterisk were not recorded as various unit prices were quoted.

Approved by C. Watson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk


